6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200  FAX (607) 334-9848

COOPERATIVE
PURCHASING

MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS & SHEET MUSIC
BID #2024-107

DCMO BOCES INFORMATION
142 Whaupaunaucau Rd
Norwich, NY 13815
Contact: Ginger Bennett
Phone #: 607-335-1412
bennettg@dcmoboces.com

Bid Prices Expire on April 30, 2025
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6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 * FAX (607) 334-9848

To: Participating Districts
From: Ginger Bennett
Date: May 1, 2024

Re: Cooperative Purchasing Musical Instruments & Sheet Music Bid Awards #2024-107

RESULTS & AWARDS:
The bid was opened on March 26, 2024 and resulted in seventeen bid submissions. One bid submission
was rejected due to the exceptions taken within the bid document.

On April 17, 2024, the bid award recommendations were presented to the DCMO BOCES Board. The bid
award recommendations were approved and awarded by the Board.

Please see the attached “Musical Instruments & Sheet Music Bid Awards” in a PDF format. These are the
results of the bid award recommendations. Any district in the service may take advantage of this award,
even if the district did not participate in the initial requisitioning of items. The vendor contact sheet will
give you additional information regarding the awarded bidder, such as the address, phone number, contact
person, etc.

Please make sure your PO’s include the Bid Number 2024-107

IMPORTANT BID INFORMATION:
Please note that according to our contract the awarded vendors must follow these terms:

e Must deliver and invoice within 35 days from the date the vendor confirms they received the
purchase order. (If a vendor fails to deliver in this time, please contact our office, as we may
implement the Buy Against Clause)

Pricing is firm until 4/30/25.

Must provide the brand they specified on the bid throughout the bid contract.

Must not substitute any item unless they have advance approval from the district.

Cannot say an item is discontinued or no longer available, and offer you a higher priced item. —

PLEASE CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY - Substitutions must be at the bid price.

Must not include shipping, handling or fuel surcharges on any order meeting minimum.

e You can combine orders for other items not on bid with any purchase order containing bid items
to reach the minimum ordering amount (if applicable).

DISCOUNTS:

The vendors who offer discounts off their website or catalog are listed below. If the item you need is not
within this bid, you can search for the item utilizing the discounts from the vendors to ensure that you are
getting the best possible price. Sometimes a 15% discount from one vendor is better than a 20% discount
from another vendor but you must do your research and also look at minimum order amounts. Please
review the discount analysis for further information.



6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200  FAX (607) 334-9848

NO BID ITEMS/REJECTED ITEMS

If you see any price that shows as $0.00 on any reports or online this means the item in question did NOT
RECEIVE A BID. The item was either discontinued or not available from the vendors who provided a
bid. The No Bid items may have a suitable substitution within the bid awards.

PRODUCT QUALITY / VENDOR ISSUE RESOLUTION PROCESS:
If you have a Product Quality problem or Vendor Issue, please follow the process below:

1. Call the vendor contact person. Note the date and time you called about the issue. Make sure to
have them give you a time or date that the problem will be resolved. Make sure you get the
person’s name and their phone number.

2. If the problem is not resolved or the person you spoke to is not responsive to correcting the
problem, please email us the information below:
a. Details of the problem
The company you having an issue with
The PO Number and/or Invoice number
Your customer number
The person’s name at the company you spoke to about the issue and their phone #
Variance form

me o o

Once we have the information we will work with the vendor and copy you on the email. If you need to
speak with us for any reason, you can email us at cooppur@dcmoboces.com. Feel free to call or email us
with your issues or concerns. We will try our best to get it sorted!

READING THE PDF AWARDS:
To search the PDF, there is a “find” box in the tool bar or use CTL & F on your keyboard. A search bar
will appear and from there you can type in any keyword to find the items you are looking for.
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Artist Pianos

6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200  FAX (607) 334-9848

Vendor Contact Information

Paul Jennings

664 New Loudon Rd Ste. 2

artistpianospaul@gmail.com

Latham, NY 12110

Baroque Violin Shop

P: 518-783-1695

Free Shipping

www.artist-pianos.com

David Smarelli

P: 513-206-8978

Free Shipping

1038 W. North Bend Rd.

vi r violinshop.com

Cincinnati, OH 45224

Universal Melody Online DBA:

F: 513-541-2019

30 days to return

www.barogueviolinshop.com

Bryce Sarabia

Brook May Music

brycesarabia@brookmays.com

8605 John Carpenter Frwy

P: 214-905-8614

$25.00 Min. Free
Shipping

www.brookmays.com

Dallas, TX 75247

Hickey Music

F: 214-905-4964

30 days to return

Charles De Paolo

104 Adams Street

chuck@hickeys.com

P: 607-272-8262

Return with RMA

Ithaca, NY 14850

K&S Music

www.hickeys.com

Shanna Silver P:

908-780-0400 x 25

61 Industrial Rd.

slr@kandsmusic.com

Berkeley Heights, NJ 07922

Music & Arts Center

F: 908-790-0407

Free Shipping

www.kandsmusic.com

Katherine Burns

P: 301-620-4040

5295 Westview Dr. Ste 300

schools@musicarts.com

F: 301-620-2567

Free Shipping

Frederick, MD 21703

Music in Motion

www.musicarts.com

Customer Service Dept.

P: 800-445-0649

30 days to return

1601 E Plano Pkwy

orders@musicmotion.com

F: 866-943-8906

Free Shipping

STE 100

WWW.musicmotion.com

30 days to return

Plano, TX 75074

Plank Road Publishing

Customer Service

P: 800-437-0832

PO BOX 26627

customerservice@music8.com

F: 888-272-0212

Free Shipping

Wauwatosa, WI 53226

WWWw.music8.com

30 days to return

l
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Poppa's Music

6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200  FAX (607) 334-9848

Support

168 Jericho Turnpike

support@poppasmusic.com

P: 516-747-5107

$25.00 Min. Free S/H

Mineola, NY 11501

Shar Products Co.

WWW.poppasmusic.com

Jonathan Peters

7% restocking fee

Free Shipping

2465 S. Industrial Hwy

schools@sharmusic.com

P: 866-742-7261

30 days to return

Ann Arbor, MI 48104

www.sharmusic.com

Restocking fee may

Southwest Strings

Tiffany Johnson

P: 800-528-3430

Free Shipping

1721 S. Cherrbell Strav

schools@swstrings.com

Tucson, AZ 85713

Taylor Music

F: 800-528-3470

30 days to return

WWW.swstrings.com

Mary McKinney

$25.00 Min. Free
Shipping

513 S. Main St

Mary@taylormusic.com

P: 800-872-2263

Delivery time may vary

Aberdeen, SD 57401

www.taylormusic.com

Washington Music Sales Center, Inc

F: 605-225-2051

depending on availability

Brenda Clark

30 day+ at this time

$25.00 Min. Free
Shipping

11151 Veirs Mill Road

orders@chucklevins.com

P: 301-979-2495

Returns based on a

Wheaton, MD 20902

www.chucklevins.com

case by case basis

Owatonna, MN 55060

Wenger Corp Jim Roy P: 507-774-8339 Free Shipping
555 Park Drive iim.roy@wenger.com P: 800-493-6437 x 8339 Return with RMA

www.wengercorp.com

F: 507-455-4258

West Music Beth Villhauer Free Shipping
1212 5th St bids@westmusic.com P: 800-397-9378 45 Day returns
PO Box 5521 www.westmusic.com F: 888-470-3942 Software & media

Coralville, 1A 52241

are non-returnable

Port Washington, NY 11050

Wright Music Chrystal Conklin
$25.00 Min. Free
5 Main St wrightmusiconline@gmail.com P: 516-883-0043 Shipping

WWW.Wright-music.com

Return with RMA
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Discounts Offered for Items NOT on Bid

Artist Piano 8% Steinway NY Retail Pianos Only
Price
Baroque Violin 50% Website & Catalog Violins, Viola, Cello, Bass, Bows, Cases
Shop $25.00 Minimum Only
Poppa's Music 10% Website - $50.00 Ukulele, Guitars, Percussion, Pro Audio
Minimum Only




Gibson Earl Scruggs Signature Medium Banjo Strings 38985 _ $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Euphonium - RS Berkeley 3 Valve Brass Finish w/Hard Case - BAR903 26568 $995.00 | K&S Music
EACH Baritone - Jupiter 360L, 3/4 size, Bb Student Horn, Lacquered Brass 26965 $0.00
Body NO BID
EACH Baritone - RS Berkeley BAR907 27732 $1,295.00 | K&S Music
PAIR Snare Drum Stick Pairs, Vic Firth Corpsmaster Signature, Ralph 100402 VFHARDIMON $12.50 | Wright Music Inc.
Hardimon
EACH 20" Bass Drum Heads, Yamaha 100405 0002832 $54.48 | Music & Arts
EACH 22" Bass Drum Heads, Yamaha 100406 0002829 $57.46 | Music & Arts
EACH Remo, Powermax 2, Bass Drum 20" 100407 1472737 $42.72 | Music & Arts
EACH Remo, Powermax 2, Bass Drum 22" 100408 1472729 $46.52 | Music & Arts
EACH Remo, Powermax 2, Bass Drum 24" 100409 1472738 $49.36 | Music & Arts
EACH 22" White Bass Drum, Yamaha Field 100424 DH-BR-1222 $48.11 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH 24" White Bass Drum, Yamaha Field 100426 DH-BR-1224 $51.86 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Snare Drums (BG Blue), Yamaha 100427 $0.00 | NO BID
EACH Dynasty DFW Performance Wedge Marching Snare Drum - Black 2024034 1593222 $568.97 | Music & Arts
EACH Remo Kids Percussion DP-25TU-01 Set of 3 Nested Tubanos 2024040 1594047 $231.59 | Music & Arts
EACH Drum Sticks 5A 26971 $3.75 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Remo Coated Vintage Emperor Tom Drumhead Pack (10", 12", 14") 34102 1108786 $39.82 | Music & Arts
SET Remo Kids Percussion KD-0500-01 5pc Frame Drum Set, Rain Forest 341030 0040105 $76.56 | Music & Arts
EACH 8" Remo Practice Pad and Stand 37509 19186 $60.57 | Hickey's Music Center
PKG 5B Drum Sticks Value Pack-4 Pair, Vic Firth VP5B35B1X-P 49687 5B $45.85 | Washington Music Center
EACH Reeds - Clarinet - Strength 3-1/2, Mitchell Lurie - 10/Pkg 23749 RML10BCL350 $10.00 | Universal Melody Service -
DBA Brook Mays
EACH Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 3-1/2 Rico - 25/Pkg 23747 000577 $26.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH String Bass Outfit - Size 1/2 Shen, Franz Hoffmann Amadeus Bass 23722 PB100OFT12 $1,155.00 | Shar Products
Outfit




Reeds - Bassoon - Jones Medium

0027497

Music & Arts

Bow Right 3/4-4/4 - BS1 44

1045006

$14.99

Music & Arts

Cello Outfit - 1/2 Size, EASTVC8012 26416 - $606.36 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH D'Addario Prelude Cello Strings SIZE 4/4 "A" String 2024100 79987-A $6.16 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH D'Addario Prelude Cello Strings SIZE 4/4 "G" string 2024103 79990-G $8.65 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Kaces University Deluxe Cello Bag 12mm SIZE 3/4 2024111 075979 $59.97 | Hickey's Music Center

SET D'Addario Prelude Cello Strings SIZE: 4/4 SET 2024114 SDPCS4/4 $39.00 | Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Cello Bow - Size 4/4 - Glasser Fiberglass with White Horsehair - 23710 BCFG4-4 $40.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
F402R44

SET String Set - Cello - 4/4 Size Super Sensitive Red Label - 307ST-P 26418 SCSSS4-4 $33.00 | Baroque Violin Shop

SET String Set - Cello - 4/4 Dominant 'A' Strings 26926 D142A44M $28.37 | Shar Products

EACH Baroque Violin Shop Endpin Strap 51395 EPS-C $8.50 | Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Schmidt Workshop Brazilwood Cello Bow - 3/4 Size 51522 KCB34 $20.95 | Shar Products

EACH Tourte Style 2 Hole Cello Mute 55907 0143352 $2.85 | Music & Arts

EACH Clarinet - Yamaha YCL255 23670 YEP-255 $407.00 | Taylor Music Inc.

EACH RS Berkeley Bass Clarinet - BC310 26943 $1,960.00 | K&S Music

EACH Bass Clarinet - Yamaha Intermediate - YCL221lII 27726 YCL-221lI $2,000.00 | Taylor Music Inc.

EACH Buffet Crampon Premium Student B-flat Clarinet - 139021 51455 BC2539-2-0GB $514.00 | Universal Melody Service -

DBA Brook Mays

EACH Ligatures and Caps - Bb Clarinet - Rovner Dark 23744 $19.95 | Poppa's Music Inc

BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength: 3 Rico - 10/Box 23746 RCA1030 $15.25 | Washington Music Center
PKG Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 2.5 Rico - 25/Pkg 23748 REA2525 $68.95 | Washington Music Center
PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.5 Rico - 25/Pkg 23754 RCA1025 $21.00 | Universal Melody Service -

DBA Brook Mays

PKG Reeds - Bass Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Vandoren - 5/Pkg 23759 CR1225 $20.55 | Washington Music Center
PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Vandoren - 10/Pkg 23760 CR1025 $21.80 | Washington Music Center
PKG Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 3, Vandoren - 10/Pkg 23761 CR103 $21.80 | Washington Music Center
EACH Juno Bass Clarinet Reeds, Box of 25, strength 2.5 23779 JCR312525 $60.45 | Washington Music Center
EACH Mouthpiece - Clarinet - Yamaha Plastic Bb - CURRENT MODEL 26431 YAC CL4C $30.10 | Washington Music Center




SET Cushion - Clarinet - Yamaha for Saxophone/Clarinet - .3 mm - 6/Set - 26975 133736 $9.19 | Hickey's Music Center
133736

EACH Cushion - Thum-Eez Clarinet Thumb Rest 26976 0003290 $1.20 | Music & Arts

EACH Ligature - Metal Tradition Clarinet 26977 026774 $4.34 | Hickey's Music Center

PKG Vandoren, Mouthpiece Cushions, Black, Thick, VMCX6, 6-pack - 51393 $10.75 | Poppa's Music Inc
098224

PKG Reeds - Alto Clarinet - Strength 2.0, Rico - 25/Box 51496 RBA2525 $47.00 | Universal Melody Service -

DBA Brook Mays
BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.0, Juno - 25/Box 51505 JCR01225 $31.25 | Washington Music Center
BOX Reeds - Bb Clarinet - Strength 2.5, Juno - 25/Box 51506 JCR012525 $31.25 | Washington Music Center

EACH Flute - RS Berkeley F102 23676 $299.00 | K&S Music
EACH Flute - RS Berkeley F102 23677 $299.00 | K&S Music
EACH Flute - RS Berkeley F110 - 3SHB Intermediate, offset G, B foot 35710 $875.00 | K&S Music
EACH BO Pep Flute Saddle, Woodwind Brasswind Co. - 460143000000000 49711 023949 $8.86 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH French Horn - Conn 6D Double 26434 6D $3,178.05 | Washington Music Center

EACH French Horn - Holton Single F - 14D 26438 $1,963.00 | Universal Melody Service -
DBA Brook Mays

EACH Blessing BFH-1287 Standard Series Single F French Horn 51453 BFH-1287 $751.10 | Washington Music Center

EACH Fender Deluxe Jazz Bass Case - Tweed 2024035 0124866 $300.00 | Music & Arts

SET String Set - Acoustic Guitar - Martin 80/20 Bronze Wound Extra Light 23816 119928 $5.89 | Hickey's Music Center
SET String Set - Classical Normal Tension, D'Addario EJ27N 23817 002386 $5.99 | Hickey's Music Center
DOZ Guitar Picks - Medium Fender - Dozen 23819 0055727 $4.65 | Music & Arts

EACH Guitar Capo - Dunlop Trigger Classical - 361511 001 Model #88B 26974 $13.50 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Acoustic Guitar - 3/4 Size Yamaha JR1 26998 300930 $120.15 | West Music

EACH Electric Guitar - Rogue RR100 Rocketeer 27084 1104596 $97.18 | Music & Arts

EACH Electric Guitar - Rogue RR100 Rocketeer 27084 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Epiphone Les Paul 100 Electric Guitar Vintage Sunburst 38976 $0.00 | NO BID

SET D'Addario EJ74 Phosphor Bronze Medium Mandolin Strings (11-40) 38986 017446 $6.52 | Hickey's Music Center
SET D'Addario Pro-Arte Nylon Classical guitar strings-normal tension - EJ45 | 51400 EJ45 $7.18 | Shar Products

SET D'Addario Phosphor Bronze Acoustic guitar strings - EJ16-3D 51403 EJ16-3D $16.23 | Shar Products




EACH Mouthpiece - Yamaha French Horn 26931 YAC HR30C4 $34.65 | Washington Music Center

EACH Mini Keyboards 101213 $0.00 | NO BID
EACH Roland FP-E50 88-Key Keyboard, hammer action 101229 FP-E50-BK $771.75 | Washington Music Center
EACH Essex, By Steinway & Sons Grand Piano 2023525 $14,628.00 | Artist Pianos Ltd.
EACH Clavimover - Piano Dolly Vanda-King's Piano Showcase Product: 51525 $0.00
Jansen Grand Piano with Locking Wheels NO BID

EACH Oboe - Fox 330 26459 MODEL 330 $3,719.00 | Washington Music Center

EACH Jones Oboe Reed Medium - WWBW - 462688 000118000 35714 0025247 $12.86 | Music & Arts

EACH Eastman, Oboe Reed - Medium/Soft - 074535 51388 074535 $10.99 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Emerald Plastic Oboe Reed, Medium 55813 1306607 $8.29 | Music & Arts

EACH Trophy Sand block Pair 4966 2024027 1026248 $4.16 | Music & Arts

EACH Adams VCGF30M 3.0-octave Concert Endurance Series Vibraphone 2024033 VCGF30M $5,580.85 | Washington Music Center
with Motor and Field Frame

EACH West Music - 6 Inch Brass Cymbals 202409 205134 $15.45 | West Music

EACH Basic Beat 10" Red Plastic Rhythm Sticks 2024105 205536 $3.00 | West Music

EACH Music in Motion Bamboo Woodblock 7 1/4 inches w/ mallet 2024107 4989 $12.51 | Music In Motion

EACH Stagg 5-Piece Wooden Temple Block Set 25 in. WB-SET 5B 2024108 1431254 $121.50 | Music & Arts

EACH West Music - Remo Fiberskyn 10 Inch Tambourine 202411 201436 $20.34 | West Music

SET Boomwhackers BWJG 7-Note Bass Diatonic Set 2024121 132430 $31.99 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Sound Choice, 8" Multi-colored Rhythm sticks/Rhythm 26002 204922 $2.90 | West Music

EACH Basic Beat BB201 Egg Shaker 26006 202376 $1.57 | West Music

EACH Boomwhackers BWCAPS Octavator Tube Cap 26007 131697 $7.00 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Stand - Snare Drum, Double Brace - Ludwig LM921SS 26482 0061576 $72.82 | Music & Arts

SET Timpani - 23, 26, 29 and 32" Set - Ludwig 26498 LTS404FG $9,380.00 | Universal Melody Service -

DBA Brook Mays

SET Bell Set - 5 Large Sleigh Bells Mounted Handle Grip - RB805 26504 136487 $3.93 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Bells - Agogo Bells with Mallets - RB702 26953 134437 $17.06 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Bell Kit - Student Bell Kit includes a lightweight aluminum Bells, Starts | 26963 SPK-285R $294.85 | Washington Music Center
on F, X-style Bell Stand, Music Stand, Student Percussion Mallets,
Practice Snare Pad with Rolling Cart - Yamaha SPK-285R




EACH Triangle - 4" Steel Triangle with Striker and Holder - WMHO07 26978 203767 $4.00 | West Music
EACH Woodblock with Mallet - Basic Beat BBHHO5 26979 203765 $5.61 | West Music
SET Boomwhackers 8-note C Major Diatonic Set - BWDG 26993 200346 $19.49 | West Music
SET Rhythm Band Claves Select Hardwood 34165 126738 $4.69 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Cowbell, Westco BE7202 55922 204379 $7.23 | West Music

EACH Konga - Kids Remo Rainforest - 6 X 15 26484 200590 $42.24 | West Music
EACH Djembe - Kids Remo Rainforest - 8 X 14" - KD060801 26485 200678 $89.11 | West Music

| EACH | Piccolo-RSBerkeleyPlor  [26538 | |  $639.20 K& Music |
EACH Alto Saxophone Cleaning Swab 202414 0194928 $3.96 | Music & Arts
EACH Protec Saxophone Neck Strap with Velour Neck Pad and Plastic Swivel | 202415 137442 $8.36 | Hickey's Music Center

Snap, 24-in. Length

EACH Alto Saxophone - Yamaha YAS26 26394 YAS-26 $991.85 | Washington Music Center
EACH Baritone Saxophone - Yamaha YBS52 with Case - CURRENT MODEL 26396 YBS-480 $4,837.00 | Washington Music Center
EACH Tenor Saxophone - RS Berkeley TSS536 26944 $1,595.00 | K&S Music
EACH Padded Saxophone Neck Strap 35715 0047267 $10.31 | Music & Arts
EACH Giardinelli Alto Saxophone Swab , Woodwind Brasswind co. 202478 0024001 $3.50 | Music & Arts
EACH Yamaha YAC1607 Alto Saxophone Ligature 202480 YAC 1607 $5.65 | Washington Music Center
BOX Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico, Strength 3, 25/Pkg 23766 RJA2530 $48.45 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Rico Strength 2.5 - 25/Pkg 23770 RLA2525 $86.30 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor Vandoren V16 - Strength 2.5 - 5/Pkg 23776 SR7225 $20.55 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico Royal Strength 2.5 - 25/Pkg 26542 1578253 $62.40 | Music & Arts
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico - Strength 3 - 10/Pkg 26543 RKA1030 $28.65 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico Strength 3.5 — 25/Pkg 26544 RJA2535 $48.45 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Rico - Strength 2.5 - 25/Pkg 26545 RJA2525 $48.45 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren - Strength 2.5 - 10/Pkg 26547 SR2125 $28.40 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Vandoren - Strength 3 - 10/Pkg 26548 SR213 $28.40 | Washington Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Vandoren - Strength 2.5 - 5/Pkg 26550 SR2425 $36.65 | Washington Music Center
EACH Mouthpiece - Saxophone Alto, Yamaha Plastic - YAC1286 26552 $29.95 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Strap - Saxophone Neotech Soft, Regular, Swivel Hook - Black 26941 116365 $15.85 | Hickey's Music Center
PKG Saxophone Reeds - Baritone, Rico Strength 3 - 10/Pkg 26968 $38.99 | Poppa's Music Inc




EACH APM Tenor Saxophone Ligature 38959 004784 $3.11 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH APM Baritone Saxophone Ligature 38960 $9.00 [ Poppa's Music Inc

EACH Alto Saxophone Standard Ligature, Woodwind and Brasswind -APM 49710 004783 $5.32 | Hickey's Music Center
334G

BOX Saxophone Reeds - Alto - Juno - Strength 2.0, - 25/Box 51498 JSR61225 $46.70 | Washington Music Center

BOX Saxophone Reeds - Alto, Juno - Strength 2.5, - 25/Box 51499 JSR612525 $46.70 | Washington Music Center

BOX Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico Orange - Strength 2, Box - 25/Box 51509 000558 $44.32 | Hickey's Music Center

BOX Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Rico Orange - Strength 3.5, Box - 25/Box 51510 RKA2535 $68.10 | Washington Music Center
Saxophone Reeds - Tenor, Juno - Strength 2.5 - 25/Box 55846 JSR712525 $59.50 | Washington Music Center

EACH

Trombone BLESSING MOUTHPIECE 7C

26563

$44.00

EACH Yamaha Trombone - YSL354 23675 YSL-354 $550.70 | Washington Music Center
EACH Trombone - Bach Student Bb - TB301 26554 TB301 $549.95 | Washington Music Center
EACH Bach 6-1/2 AL Silver Trombone Mouthpieces #39075 - Large Shank 26617 3416HAL $62.70 | Washington Music Center

Poppa's Music Inc

EACH

EACH

Bach 6-1/2 AL Silver Trombone Mouthpieces #44391 - Small Shank

Mute - Trumpet, Straight, Humes and Berg Model #101

26619

26972

3506HAL

0008042

$62.70

EACH Trumpet, RS Berkeley TP6540 23668 ] $425.00 | K&S Music

$16.57

Washington Music Center

Music & Arts

EACH

EACH

Mute - Trumpet, Harmon B Model A1 wow-wow

Tuba, 3 Valve 3/4 BBb, RS Berkeley TUB907

34156

26950

093250

$28.67

$2,295.00

Hickey's Music Center

K&S Music

EACH

EACH

Tuba, 3/4 Size RS Berkeley TUB907

Artino Full Size Viola Shoulder Rest

05551

49692

SRAVA4-4

$2,295.00

$17.00

K&S Music

Baroque Violin Shop

this size

EACH Super-Sensitive Red Label Viola Strings, 303SH-P, Size 13, Med, Steel 55898 303513M $19.59 | Shar Products
wrap/core, Bell
EACH Overture Ultra Viola string set, Red Label no longer manufactured in 55899 U200S12 $18.60 | Shar Products




EACH

Deluxe Shaped Thermoplastic Violin/Viola CASE 3/4 SIZE

2024112

105C34

$49.95

Shar Products

Strings, Thermoplastic Case, Brazilwood Bow and BVS Rosin

EACH Baroque Violin Shop Academy 200 3/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude 23693 120VN3-4 $265.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
Strings, Thermoplastic Case, Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS Rosin

EACH 4/4 KM Etude Violin Outfit - Mozart 6105A 23694 $249.00 | K&S Music

EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 4/4 - Fiberglass with white horsehair. 23695 BVNFG4-4 $29.00 | Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 3/4 - Fiberglass with white horsehair - 23696 BVNFG3-4 $29.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
C202R34

EACH Glasser Violin Bow - Size 1/2 - Fiberglass with white horsehair - 23697 BVNFG1-2 $29.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
C202R12

SET 1/2 Violin PRIM Set of Strings - P227SH 23701 P227S-H $27.38 | Southwest Strings

SET 3/4 Violin PRIM Set of Strings 23702 P227S-T $27.38 | Southwest Strings

SET 4/4 Violin DOMINANT Set of Strings 23703 STDVNSEB $48.00 | Baroque Violin Shop

EACH Baroque Violin Shop Academy 200 3/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude 26580 120VN3-4 $265.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
Strings, Thermoplastic Case, Glasser Fiberglass Bow and BVS Rosin

EACH Baroque Violin Shop Academy 200 1/2 Violin Outfit with Prelude 26585 120VN1-2 $265.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
Strings, Thermoplastic Case, Brazilwood Bow and BVS Rosin

EACH Baroque Violin Shop Academy 200 4/4 Violin Outfit with Prelude 26592 120VN4-4 $265.00 | Baroque Violin Shop

299544 M

EACH D'Addario Prelude Violin Strings SIZE 4/4 "D" String 2024101 SDPVND4/4 $4.25 | Baroque Violin Shop
SET String Set - 3/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red Label - 299ST-P 26600 299534 $12.63 | Shar Products
SET String Set - 4/4 Violin, Super-Sensitive Red Label - Medium Gauge - 28434 299SB44M $12.63 | Shar Products

EACH Shoulder Rest Replacement Nuts, Kun for Violin/Viola Collapsible 2024115 1313CN $0.90 | Shar Products
COLOR: Nut

EACH Artino 4/4 Violin Shoulder Rest 2024116 SRAVN4-4 $15.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
EACH Artino 4/4 Violin Shoulder Rest 23704 SRAVN4-4 $15.00 | Baroque Violin Shop
PKG Sonor ZS1 Black Pins for Xylophone - 10/Pkg 26996 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH 4/4 Mulko violin chinrest 34183 1124 $3.95 | Shar Products

EACH Everest Violin Shoulder Rest (EZ Series) 4/4 38965 133844 $10.65 | Shar Products

EACH Everest Violin Shoulder Rest (EZ Series) 3/4 38966 133834 $10.65 | Shar Products




Sonor 51 Black Pins for Xylophone - 10/Pkg 26996 261188 $7.27

EACH Recorder - Soprano Yamaha YRS-24B (3 pc) 23821 400295 $4.55 | West Music
EACH Recorder - Soprano Yamaha, Plastic - YRS-23 26606 400294 $4.55 | West Music
EACH Recorder - Soprano Angel One Piece 27731 400215 $2.45 | West Music
EACH Recorder Reward Belt Holders K8#MP-TP50 38951 1330617 $6.95 | Music & Arts
EACH Macie Publishing, 5 Recorders when recorder order is placed. Blue or K668 $0.00

black recorders with zip case NO BID
EACH West World Guitar-Ukulele Rack, 18 slots 1027100 $0.00 | NO BID
EACH Troubadour Ukulele Chord Changer 2024119 356837 $17.16 | West Music
EACH Ukulele, Cordoba 15CM Concert - Makala MK-C 23739 303686 $59.32 | West Music
EACH Diamond Head Ukulele, brown - Music in Motion 2811 49668 1125624 $44.79 | Music & Arts
EACH Music in Motion Bongos Prime Grade Kiln-dried hardwood; selected 26952 4517 $43.35 | Music In Motion

skin heads; 6inches Head sizes: 5.75" and 5"

SET Music Symbols Bulletin Board Set 1041002 4410 $17.14 | Music In Motion
EACH 8" Quad Heads, Remo Pinstripe 104103 1026381 $14.22 | Music & Arts

EACH Hoop Protectors for Bass Drums, Pearl BDR1 104104 0053650 $32.35 | Music & Arts

EACH Remo White Max Marching 13" Snare Drum Heads 104110 0039721 $51.43 | Music & Arts

EACH Concert Band Bass Drum Sticks 104111 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Bass Drum Traveling Case, 18" Yamaha 104114 PCH-MB18 $112.49 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Bass Drum Traveling Case, 20" Yamaha 104115 PCH-MB20 $119.36 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Snare Drum Traveling Case, 14" Yamaha 104116 PCH-MB14 $103.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Bass Drum Traveling Case, 22" Yamaha 104117 PCH-MB22 $143.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Bass Drum Traveling Case, 24" Yamaha 104118 PCH-MB24 $161.86 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Quad/Quint Traveling Case Yamaha 104119 PCH-MQLS $201.86 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Snare Drum Harnesses, Yamaha 104121 RM-PLS $113.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Bass Drum Carriers, Yamaha 104122 RM-PLB $113.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Vibraphone Motor 104125 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Hand Drum Bundle 104128 $0.00 | NO BID




EACH Baroque Violin Shop microfiber polishing cloth 9.5" x 11.5" 2024102 PCM $3.50 | Baroque Violin Shop
EACH Hot Jams for Recorder with Guitar and Drums, by Jim Solomon 2024104 841140 $18.16 | West Music
EACH The Tropical Recorder, by Jim and Mary Helen Solomon 2024106 816560 $19.59 | West Music
EACH Basic Beat BB710 Clave Companion 2024117 251630 $3.40 | West Music
EACH Rhythm Band 12 Colored Scarves RB3004 2024118 0099326 $20.42 | Music & Arts
EACH Basic Beat BBCO1 Plastic Finger Castanet 2024120 204133 $0.58 | West Music
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Alto Sax) 202419 $17.95 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Bass Clarinet) 202420 $18.95 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Clarinet) 202421 041922 $9.36 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Flute) 202422 074554 $9.67 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Hodge Silk Swab (Tenor Sax) 202423 050636 $19.36 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH West Music - Bobcat Mouthpiece Puller 202427 450449 $47.99 | West Music
EACH Treeworks Professional Stainless Steel Triangle Beater / Striker, Set of 23825 1056898 $11.99 | Music & Arts

3 TREO3btr
SET Rhythm Band 12 colored scarves 23827 0099326 $20.42 | Music & Arts
EACH Selmer Slide Grease - 2942 23832 025741 $3.65 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Allied Music Supply Double Spring Hook Tool T1724 23834 1047267 $7.54 | Music & Arts
KIT Herco Mini Repair Kit 23841 132436 $26.12 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH 3" Gaffer's Stage Tape - 60 Yd. Roll Black 26949 120158 $23.98 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Cork Grease - 15 Oz Tube 26970 $0.75 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Sterisol Germicide Concentrate - 8 oz 34117 451428 $5.64 | West Music
EACH Mi-T-Mist Mouthpiece Cleaner Disinfectant, 32 oz. 1003-RT125 35725 452039 $13.72 | West Music
PKG Music Certificates - 25/pkg - 23516 35783 23516 $7.43 | Music In Motion
EACH Mouthpiece Shank Repair Tool - A04tt995 38952 021697 $21.74 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH 9-1/2" X 12-1/4" Music Folders - Small DS129S 49699 FOL1 $1.15 | Shar Products
EACH Ferree's H70 Quick-Dry Cork Cement - RP910 51406 132117 $13.69 | Hickey's Music Center
BOX "I Love Chorus" Music Pencils - 144/Box - 4826 51515 4826 $51.41 | Music In Motion
EACH Fingerboard Tape, 40' Roll - FT6BLR - Blue 55752 FT6BLR $10.25 | Southwest Strings
EACH Fingerboard Tape, 40' Roll - FT6YR - Yellow 55755 FT6YR $10.25 | Southwest Strings
SET Mallets - Yarn Covered 23822 0049791 $24.29 | Music & Arts
SET Mallets - Bell Vic Firth, M11 23823 0054773 $21.99 | Music & Arts
SET Mallets - Vibe Vic Firth Medium - M186 23828 0063966 $43.57 | Music & Arts
SET Mallets - Timpani Vic Firth Vic - T3 23830 004834 $32.47 | Hickey's Music Center




PAIR Mallets - ORFF Medium Yarn Xylophone/Metallophone - Basic Beat 26997 261016 $11.30 | West Music
BBYM

EACH Goodwood 12-Pack Drum Sticks 5B Nylon 289501 1022340 $55.26 | Music & Arts

EACH Vater Gospel, Fusion Drumsticks 51300 1076209 $8.91 | Music & Arts

EACH Vater Staccato Timpani Mallets - T2 51479 00249989 $30.20 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Vater General Timpani Mallets - T3 51480 1027036 $26.37 | Music & Arts

EACH Vater Legato Timpani Mallets - T4 51481 1028014 $26.37 | Music & Arts

EACH Vater Tympani, Mallets T5 514810 1026596 $26.37 | Music & Arts

Susan Brumfield

EACH Behringer Eurolive F1220D 250W 12 inch Active Floor Monitor 2024037 $0.00 | NO BID
EACH Yamaha BR12M 600W 12 inch Passive Floor Monitor 2024038 0046143 $231.80 | Music & Arts
EACH Fender Champion 40 Guitar Combo Amp Black 38981 600787 $163.43 | West Music
EACH Land of the Free, sheet music - 10355899 10355899 ALF39782 $2.25 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH 4-12 Band, Lesson, and Ensemble Music. 2024025 $0.00 | NO BID
EACH Bandroom Boogie 2024028 1199878 $37.50 | Music & Arts
EACH The Magnificent Five Band set and score by Mark Williams 2024031 ALF29436 $37.95 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Great Beginnings (for any combination of instruments) Band set and 2024032 1541071 $29.54 | Music & Arts
score By Michael Kamuf
EACH Warp Speed 2024039 0197883 $32.86 | Music & Arts
EACH Counterpoint, Partner Songs and Canons for Singers of Any Age 2024109 ALF49856 $24.00 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH We Love Our Veterans 2024110 WL116 $31.60 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH It's Raining Cats and Dogs by Ingrid Koller 2024113 GMS-RCD $35.60 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH The Emperor's New Clothes Dave & Jean Perry - Alfred Music 2024124 ENC-S10 $55.30 | Hickey's Music Center
Publishing PACK - SCORE/10 SINGERS
EACH Manuscript Paper, Green Cover - The Music Rack 881884995 49661 0021125 $3.22 | Music & Arts
EACH First We Sing-Kodaly Inspired Teaching for the Music Classroom by 558231 HL00118549 $17.50 | Hickey's Music Center

1817691

EACH JW Pepper, The Black Folder Choir Ring Binder Music Folder 3-Ring 202487 $0.00

Binder with 2 Expanding Pockets NO BID
EACH 12 X 14 Humes & Berg Band Folio w/ Expanding Pocket - F7100 27735 1321561 $13.52 | Music & Arts
EACH 9-1/2 X 12-1/2 Folio Model 101 Choral Folder, Black w/ White Notes - | 49722 1308726 $1.00 | Music & Arts




EACH Mallet Madness Interactive SMART Edition CD-ROM 10641020 840124 $29.03 | West Music

EACH Games, Groups, and Gems (Book and CD-ROM) 10766966 10766966 864310 $19.59 | West Music

EACH Clarinet Achievement Book 1 2024029 027360 $6.45 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Pop Partners Sally Albrecht - Alfred Music Publishing Reproducible 2024122 ALF31230 $19.47 | Hickey's Music Center
Book

EACH Concert Chorals for Unison Voices Greg Gilpin - Shawnee Press 2024123 00438972 $37.99 | Hickey's Music Center
Unison Reproducible Book & Online Audio Access

EACH Music in Motion Carnival of the Animals Hardback & CD 202454 9143 $30.83 | Music In Motion

EACH West Music - Holiday Songs and Winter Adventures 202455 870168 $29.91 | West Music

EACH West Music - The Nutcracker Book 202459 860189 $16.24 | West Music

EACH Easy Ukulele Songs by Denise Gagne - Teachers' Edition 49673 131645 $22.49 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Easy Ukulele Songs by Denise Gagne - Students' Edition 49680 131646 $6.65 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Accent on Achievement Book 1, by John O'Reilly and Mark Williams, 55775 027359 $6.47 | Hickey's Music Center
Alfred Music Publishing - Flute book 1 - 5532528

EACH Accent on Achievement Book 1 by John O'Reilly and Mark Williams 55776 027362 $6.47 | Hickey's Music Center
Alfred music publishing Alto Sax book 1

EACH Accent on Achievement book 1 by John O'Reilly and Mark Williams 55778 027366 $6.47 | Hickey's Music Center
Alfred Music Publishing trombone book 1 - 5532585

EACH Accent on Achievement book 1 by John O'Reilly and Mark Williams 55779 027364 $6.47 | Hickey's Music Center
Alfred Music Publishing Trumpet book 1 - 5532429

EACH Accent on Achievement book one John O'Reilly and Mark Williams 55780 027922 $7.77 | Hickey's Music Center
Alfred Music Publishing Snare/Bass/Accessories

EACH All American Partner Songs Book/Enhanced CD pack by Sally K 55783 MP-AF146 $37.95 | Plank Road Publishing
Albrecht - 10527335

EACH Belwin Very Beginning Band Kit No. 7 by Jack Bullock 1045102 ALF35334 $38.99 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Standard of excellence BK1 Flute - 5185939 2023529 0018053 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - Baritone BC 202469 0018066 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - Oboe 202470 0018054 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Boom-A-Tunes Curriculum Volume 3 - 821113 27037 821113 $5.45 | West Music

EACH Here's Two: A Jazz Collection for the Orff Classroom (4th-8th) - 27041 837454 $21.34 | West Music
837454




Music Company - 5186036

EACH Snow on a Moonlit Night - arr. Catherine DelLanoy (Hall Leonard) 2 27077 48023164 $1.38 | Hickey's Music Center
part Treble

EACH Standard of Excellence, Tuba, Bruce Pearson - 5186069 55890 0018067 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 Alto Sax - 5185988 55892 0018059 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 Clarinet, Bruce Pearson - Neil A. Kjos 55893 0018056 $6.80 | Music & Arts
Music Company - 5185921

EACH Standard of Excellence Book 1 - French Horn, Composed by Bruce 55894 0018063 $6.80 | Music & Arts
Pearson - 5186028

EACH Standard of Excellence BK1 Trombone, Bruce Pearson - Neil A. Kjos 55895 0018064 $6.80 | Music & Arts

EACH Student chairs, Wenger 0936121, 17.5", Black 23853 $112.99 | Wenger Corp.
EACH ORFF Table Stand, Basic Beat BBRTTS 26990 259587 $137.27 | West Music
EACH Lemur Music Ergonomic adjustable Bass Stools 34166 $0.00 [ NO BID

EACH Wenger String Bass Rack - Oyster Color Combination 55917 $1,339.00 | Wenger Corp.

EACH Ultimate Support LIVE-MC-77B mic stands 1047000 MC77B $60.00 | Universal Melody Service -
DBA Brook Mays

EACH Auray 6 Pack of Auray MS-5230F Tripod Mic Stands with Fixed Booms 2024026 $0.00

and Stand Bag Kit NO BID
EACH Music Stands - Manhasset - AC 48 26611 500171 $44.62 | West Music
EACH Carlsson Bass Rosin 1049100 CSR $8.95 | Shar Products
EACH Valve Qil - 1.6 Fl oz. 23835 $1.75 | Poppa's Music Inc
EACH Blue Juice Valve Qil - 8 oz 23836 028701 $4.11 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Dark Wood Block Rosin - Violin/Cello - Shar 1196D 26932 1196D $1.45 | Shar Products
EACH Kolstein Ultra Bass Rosin - All Weather SK3 U AW 28437 SK3UAW $10.55 | Shar Products
EACH Shar Mini Rosin 38964 1196M $1.15 | Shar Products
EACH Trombone Slide Lubricant, Slide-O-Mix 019443 51392 019443 $4.02 | Hickey's Music Center
PKG Holton Valve Oil 1.6 oz - 12/Pkg 51471 000631 $2.35 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH 1 Pair of Cymbal Holds, Zildjian Leather 105101 101168 $8.49 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Standard Cymbal Bag, 61008 105112 0001914 $89.06 | Music & Arts
EACH Sabian B8X Cymbals, 16" 105120 41606X $133.74 | Hickey's Music Center




EACH Sabian B8X Cymbals, 18" 105123 41808X $154.36 | Hickey's Music Center
EACH Musser M65S 2.5 Octave Marching Bells with Carrier 2024036 M65S $1,100.95 | Washington Music Center
EACH Orchestra Bells - Musser Classic M645 26510 M645 $1,170.45 | Washington Music Center
EACH Cymbal Cradle, Pearl Orchestral 265301 C1030AC $164.70 | Washington Music Center
EACH Rhythm Band - Chroma Notes 8 Note Diatonic Hand bells 269910 1432456 $39.12 | Music & Arts

EACH Korg Chromatic Tuners, Model CA50 23831 KT50 $19.45 | Shar Products
EACH Korg Combo Tuner Metronome TM60 28436 KTM60 $25.65 | Shar Products
SnarkX Super Tight Clip-On, All Instrument Tuner - 2784 34157 SNARKX $11.95 | Shar Products

EACH 25' Standard EXM Series Microphone Cable - Pig Hog PHM25 23843 101127 $11.00 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH 50 Ft. Pro Co Microphone Cable - Pig Hog PHM50 26609 101128 $19.69 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Male-Female Microphone Cable 10 ft, Pig Hog PHM10 38968 101124 $6.95 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Monster Cable Classic 1/4" Straight to straight Instrument - 10' -Cable | 38987 101118 $7.10 | Hickey's Music Center
Pig Hog PHO10

EACH 18.5' Instrument Cable 1/4" Straight - Pig Jog PH186 51490 101119 $9.46 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Corded Vocal Mic with Switch, Shure SM 58S 1654000 SM58S $94.85 | Washington Music Center
EACH Portable Microphone And Speaker WB001, Personal Amplifier 37183 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Blue Microphones Yeti Studio USB Condenser Microphone 38967 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Hosa GPM-103 Headphone adapter 51474 021992 $1.86 | Hickey's Music Center

EACH Music Centers Reproducible Kit #1 by Veronica Harper - 10295727 10295727 550135 $21.37 | West Music
EACH West Music - Super Simple Music Centers 202477 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Music Literacy Solfege Bingo Level 1 - SO-MI-LA - 10150124 35713 $0.00 | NO BID

EACH Rhythm Sticks Rap and Tap - CD 51444 853257 $12.28 | West Music

PKG Brass Pencil, Black with Shiny, Gold Instruments - 12/Pkg 55797 1410 $4.57 | Music In Motion
PKG Percussion Pencil, Black with shiny, copper Instruments - 12/Pkg 55872 1478 $4.57 | Music In Motion
PKG Woodwind Pencil, Black with Shiny, Silver Instruments - 12/Pkg 55926 1442 $4.57 | Music In Motion




